

University of Hull Hull, HU6 7RX United Kingdom

E: dataprotection@hull.ac.uk

w: www.hull.ac.uk

Request Ref: 2840

FOI Request dated 22/03/2023 as follows -

- 1. How many students accessed support from your university counselling service in 2022?
- 2. What was the average waiting time to access the counselling service at your university in 2022?

## Response

- 1. We do not operate an in-house counselling service. We refer to an external partner, but do not hold data on how many students actually accessed the service.
- 2. Data not held.