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FOI Request dated 01/11/2022 as follows —

1.When was your last networking (LAN, core, edge) refresh, and when is the next refresh planned?
What would you like to improve upon in your next refresh?
Could you please confirm contract end dates and current vendors for this?

2.When was your last Wi-Fi refresh, and when is the next refresh planned?
What would you like to improve upon in your next refresh?
Could you please confirm contract end dates and current vendors for this?

3.When was your last telephony or Unified Communications refresh, and when is the next refresh
planned?

What would you like to improve upon in your next refresh?

Could you please confirm contract end dates and current vendors for this?

4.Do you have an integration or workflow solution across the multiple technology systems in the
university?

5.What are the key parts of your Digital Transformation strategy going forward?

6.What adoption of Internet of Things / Smart Campus has been implemented?

Response

1.When was your last networking (LAN, core, edge) refresh, and when is the next refresh planned? —
2022 & 2027

What would you like to improve upon in your next refresh? - Information not held.

Could you please confirm contract end dates and current vendors for this? - Jan 1 2027 & Vendor SCC.

2.When was your last Wi-Fi refresh, and when is the next refresh planned? — 2022 & 2027
What would you like to improve upon in your next refresh? - Information not held.
Could you please confirm contract end dates and current vendors for this? - Jan 1 2027 & Vendor SCC.

3.When was your last telephony or Unified Communications refresh, and when is the next refresh
planned? — 2015 & 2023

What would you like to improve upon in your next refresh? — N/A

Could you please confirm contract end dates and current vendors for this? - Jun 2023 (with some
extension), vendor BT.

4.Do you have an integration or workflow solution across the multiple technology systems in the
university? - The University adopt an in-house ETL platform.




5.What are the key parts of your Digital Transformation strategy going forward? - Whilst the University
is always looking to develop and transform its digital estate it does not have a formal digital
transformation strategy at this time.

6. What adoption of Internet of Things / Smart Campus has been implemented? — BMS (Trend 963)



