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Request Ref: 2878 
 
FOI Request dated 22/05/2023 as follows –  
 
1. Revenues and spending on university owned/operated student housing for the academic year 2022/23 
and 2021/22 
2. Average price of rent per week and per year for students in 2022/23, and also cheapest and most 
expensive prices per week 
3. Average price of rent per week and per year for students in 2023/24, and also cheapest and most 
expensive prices per week  
4. Number of places for students in halls this coming year 
5. How much has rent increased this year?  
6. How much has rent increased by over the last ten years? 
7. How many applications for accommodation were received for the coming year, and of those, how many 
were accepted or rejected? 
 
Response 
 

1. Information not held in a retrievable format. 
 

2.  
• Cheapest rooms         £140 per week / £6020 per 43-week contract 
• Most Expensive          £225 per week / £11475 per 51-week contract 
• Average                       £164 per week / £6450 per 43-week contract (quoted as average as greater 

number of ensuites than other room types) 
 
3.  

• Cheapest rooms         £148.40 per week / £6381.40 per 43-week contract 
• Most expensive          £238.56 per week / £12,166 per 51-week contract 
• Average                       £163.24 per week / £7019.32 per 43-week contract (quoted as average as 

greater number of ensuites than other room types) 
 
4.  2229 (not including CY F-block) 
 
5. 6% 
 
6. Information not held. 
 
7. As of 05/06/23, 1829 signed contracts (not including reserves for Upper HYMS (40-rooms) and CEG 
(30 rooms), none rejected. 
 


