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Request Ref: 2856 
 
FOI Request dated 20/04/2023 as follows –  
 
Defibrillators access  

Please detail the number of defibrillators the university has on each of its campuses, and where each 
is located (i.e. building name and location in the building). For each, please specify whether it is 
accessible 24/7 or not, and whether an access code is required. Please also include details of 
defibrillators fitted/included in university vehicles, or any other defibrillators the university 
owns/manages.  

First aid training  
Please detail the level of first aid training security staff (in the context of those who respond to calls) 
receive to provide emergency first aid response (including emergency Mental Health First Aid). Where 
appropriate please expand on this with what qualifications or training sessions all staff receive for both 
emergency first aid and emergency Mental Health First Aid. Please include how frequently re-training 
takes place.  

Security response triage 
Where available, please detail; 
(i) The triage (or equivalent) system university security uses to prioritise calls (i.e. what method is 
used to determine how severe one call is when compared to another).  
(ii) In respect to the above, the target response time for each of the ‘categories’ or ‘levels’.  

Response times 
Where available, please detail; 
(i) The number of emergency, life threatening - for cardiac arrest and heart attack - calls the security 
team received in the 2021/22, 2020/21 and 2019/20 academic years, and the current 2022/23 
academic year if available. If specific data is not available for cardiac arrest and heart attack related 
calls, please instead provide data for life threatening calls instead.  
(ii) The average response time (i.e. in minutes) for the above, in the 2021/22, 2020/21 and 2019/20 
academic years, and the current 2022/23 academic year if available. 
(iii) The average response time (i.e. in minutes) for each of the ‘categories’ or ‘levels’ defined within 
paragraph 3 above, ‘Security response triage’.  

Response 
 
1. Defibrillators access:  
 

 



Building Location Access 24/7 Access code 
required 

Allam Medical Ground Floor No No 
Sports centre Ground Floor No No 
Sports Pavilion Ground Floor No No 
Central Print 
Services 

Ground Floor No No 

Canham Turner Ground Floor No No 
Raines house Ground Floor No No 
Brynmor Jones 
Library 

Ground Floor Yes No 

Biomechanics 
(Sports Science 
Laboratory) 

Ground Floor No No 

Washburn Ground Floor No No 
Westfield Court Ground Floor Yes No 
Venn Ground Floor Yes No 
Courtyard Ground Floor Yes No 

 
2. First aid training  
 
Security staff are trained in First Aid at Work (FAW) on a First Aid industry body (FIAB) Approved course. 
Other University first aiders either hold the above qualification or an Emergency First Aid at Work (EFAW) 
(FIAB) approved course dependent on building/areas requirements. 
 
Both of the above courses are on a 3-year renewal for training. 
 
The University of Hull has facilitated training for colleagues who provide mental health first aid, at three 
levels: 
 

1. Mental health awareness (2hr workshop) 
2. Introduction to emotional wellbeing and mental health (Canvas resources and course: 3 sessions 

[approximately 4 hours contact time])  
and / or  
Training delivered by MIND (current project supporting academic staff who run field trips for 
students) 

3. Refresher training with MIND for MHFA’s who have attended (2) in the last 2 years 
 

Our MHFA’s also have access to our suite of wellbeing online modules, our employee assistance 
programme, and podcast, video and Mental health related content.  
 
We have also hosted ‘self-care’ drop in sessions for our MHFAs where they have an opportunity to 
network, share anonymised experiences and hear about updated support (internal and external) to add to 
their ‘signposting’ resources.  
 
Security personnel are not trained in Mental Health First Aid. 
 
3. Security response triage 
Information is not held.  Security Officers are not trained in medical triage. 
 



4. Response times 
Information is not available as requests for assistance with a first aid incident are not differentiated into 
categories.  There is no differentiation between ‘life threatening’ or otherwise within our recording system. 
Therefore information not held. 
 


