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Request Ref: 2790 
 
FOI Request dated 10/01/2023 as follows –  
 
I request that a copy of documents containing the following information be provided to me in digital format: 
  
1.The partnership between this university and Rolls-Royce PLC including research contracts, investment 
funding’s, exchange programmes and procurement. 
  
2.The partnership between this university and BAE Systems including research contracts, investment 
fundings, exchange programmes and procurement. 
  
3.The partnership between this university and Hewlett Packard (HP) including research contracts, 
investment fundings, exchange programmes and procurement. 
  
4.The partnership between this university and Booking.com including research contracts, investment 
fundings, exchange programmes and procurement. 
 
Response 
 
Information not held. We cannot trace any current partnerships between the above companies which 
relates to research contracts, investment funding’s, exchange programmes and procurement.  
 
Although we do not hold the above information, we do have an apprenticeship agreement with BAE 
systems for their apprentices to come onto the final year of one of our Computer Science programmes 
after completing a Foundation Degree, in which details can be found here - 
https://www.baesystems.com/en-uk/our-company/our-businesses-uk/military-air-and-
information/apprenticeships-in-yorkshire.  
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